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SP RFB 16-005 "ASPHALT AND OIL PRODUCTS" SpreadSheet This contract is for 12 months effective Dec. S. 2015 thru December 7. 2016 

I HEARTLAND ASPHALT Asphalt & Fuel Supply Ergon Asphalt ., .. ALON WRIGHT ASPHALT 

Company HURST, TX Tulsa, OK Austin, TX DALLAS, TX HOUSTON, TX 

Phone 817 788-9700 918 488-1339 512 469-9292 972 367-3618 800882-6541 

Fax 817 788-9706 918 523-7089 512 469-0391 972 367-3722 info @Wrightasphalt.com 

YARD Wall' Carlsbad Plant Wall Carlsbad Plant Wall Carlsbad Plant Wall Carlsbad Plant Wall Carlsbad 

Me-30 $ 3.4500 $ 3.4500 $ 3.3000 $ 3.7900 $ 

MC-SOO $ 3.2500 $ 3.2500 $ 3.1000 $ 2.7300 $ 

MC-3000 $ 3.2000 $ 3.2000 $ 3.0500 $ 2.6300 $ 

RC-250 $ 2.7800 $ 

CM-300 

AC-1.5 $ 2.7500 $ 2.7500 $ 2.6500 $ 1.7900 $ 

AC-3 $ 2.7500 $ 2.7500 $ 2.6500 $ 1.7900 $ 

AC-5 $ 1.6800 $ 1.6800 $ 1.4500 $ 2.7300 $ 2.7300 $ 2.6200 $ 1.9400 $ 

AC-10 $ 1.6800 $ 1.6800 $ 1.4500 $ 2.6000 $ 2.6000 $ 2.5000 $ 1.7500 $ 1.9400 $ 

SS-1 $ 1.4009 $ 1.4119 $ 12000 

SS-1H $ 1.4009 $ 1.4119 $ 1.2000 

CSS-1H**" $ 1.7300 $ 1.7300 $ 1.5000 

CRS-2 $ 1.6800 $ 1.6800 $ 1.4500 $ 1.4119 $ 1.4119 $ 12000 $ 2.0800 $ 

CRS-2H $ 1.6800 $ 1.6800 $ 1.4500 $ 1.4119 $ 1.4119 $ 1.2000 $ 1.5400 $ 

CRS·2P $ 1.9800 $ 1.9800 $ 1.7500 $ 1.4119 $ 1.4119 $ 12000 $ 2.3300 $ 

HFRS2 $ 1.4009 $ 1.4119 $ 1.2000 

HFRS-2P $ 1.4009 $ 1.4119 $ 1.2000 

MS-2 $ 1.4009 $ 1.4119 $ 12000 

IFasBlack 
-M $ 2.2300 $ 2.2300 $ 2.0000 

EcoPrime $ 2.2300 $ 2.2300 $ 2.0000 

CRS-2TR $ 1.7900 $ 

3.8300 

2.7400 

2.6400 

2.7900 

1.8000 

1.8000 

1.9500 

1.9500 

2.1000 

1.5400 

2.3500 

1.7900 

Plant 

$ 2.7000 

$ 2.5500 

$ 2.4500 

$ 2.6000 

$ 1.6000 

$ 1.6000 

$ 1.7500 

$ 1.7500 

$ 1.3500 

$ 1.3500 

$ 1.6000 

$ 1.6000 

*5,500 gallons minimum delivery. $SO.OO per hour demmurge after 2 hours. 


** Federal Environmental Fee will be added to above prices at a rate of $.4424Iton for asphalt & polymer loads or $.00133/gal for emulsion loads. 


*** Perpitory fro .p-r\ 1-1:> ry 

**** PRICES BASED ON 5000 MINIMUM DELIVERY. CALL FOR SMALLER QTY PRICES. 


***** FOR FULL LOADS ADD: .21 PER GAL TO FOB PLANT TO WALL; .23 PER GAL TO FOB PLANT TO CARLSBAD 
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Concrete Rock NO BID $ 25.20 $15.00 NO BID NO BID $15.00 Both Pits 1.2 Ton 

D-Bedding Rock (City) NO BID NO BID $15.00 NO BID NO BID $24.00 1/4-518 1.2 Ton 

Pea Grave 114-3/8 - Good Paving Gravel 
Washed 
ASPPM (All Season Performance 
Patching Mix 

NO BID 

$120 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

$ 12.00 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

Hauling charge to work site or yard? 

Turner Pit - 6625 N. Burma Rd, Carlsbad. 
Based on Truck Size & Mileage. 
Delivery to San Angelo - 24 Ton Load + 
$7.09/Ton 
Delivery To San Angelo - 14 Ton Load + 
$10.60/Ton 

County Rd 297, Bronte 
$8.00 per ton in San Angelo property. Out of 
San Angelo City limits depends on location & 
mileage to location price will $ 8.00 to $15.00 

per ton. 

SUSAN PEAK QUARRY 
I 

12769 FM 1223 
McCREA PIT 
3 MILES EAST OF CR 235 OFF CR 285 IN RUNNELS 
CO, SE OF BRONTE 
Price is "per ton" and based on mileage to work site/yard 
from pit. 

*TxDOT 247 Type A Grade 2 
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RFB 16-007 LIME STONE ROCK ASPHALT TYPE D 

11/20/2015 

PREMIX TYPE 1 

lAA $ 
A $ 

B S 
C S 
CC $ 

0 $ 
TRAPMIX TYPE 1\ 

BS S 
CS $ 
OS $ 
FS $ 

If delivery by Plant is available 

and requested for 

full truck load quantity 

Vulcan Constuction 

Materials, lP 

RB1/3 RB 2/4 

BID PRICE BID PRICE 

70.00 $ 
70.00 $ 
71.00 $ 
71.00 $ 
71.00 $ 
73.00 $ 

71.00 $ 
71.00 S 
71.00 $ 
71.00 $ 

Delivered Prices listed - ...... __ .... __._­ -_... _- ......__ .... _­ -_.......... __ ........... _.­

Martin Marietta 

Materials 

RB 1/3 RB 2/4 

BID PRICE BID PRICE 

67.50 S 74.50 $ 72.35 

67.50 $ 74.50 $ 72.35 

68.50 NB NB 

68.50 NB NB 

68.50 NB NB 

70.50 S 73.62 S 71.47 

68.50 NB NB 

68.50 $ 81.80 $ 79.65 

68.50 $ 73.62 $ 71.47 

68.50 NB NB 

24 Ton min /1.65 per ton mile 
....... _ ........_._ .... __ ._. __ ....._._­

-~ 

Contract will be firm until Dec. 9, 2016. 
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