
SP RFB 14-006 "STATE GRADE AND ROCK BASE" SPREADSHEET PRICES ARE GOOD UNTIL DECEMBER 09. 2014 

Company 
~ 

CSA MATERIALS, INC_ 
~ 

INGRAM CONCRETE, LLC· 

Treated 

Price per Ton 

Untreated 

price per Ton 

Treated 

Price per Ton 

Untreated 

price per Ton 

State Grade #1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

State Grade #2 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID 

State Grade #3 $ 51.10 $ 25.20 NO BID NOBID 

State Grade #4 $ 52.45 $ 25.20 NO BID NO BID 

State Grade #5 $ 52.45 $ 25.20 NO BID NOBID 

State Grade Base NO BID $ 7.50 NO BID NOBID 

Pre-Coat Grade #3 $ 51.10 NO BID NO BID NOBID 

Pre-Coat Grade #4 $ 52.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID ! 

Pre-Coat Grade #5 $ 52.45 NO BID NOBID NO BID 

Black Base with PG 64-22 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID 

Cobbs NO BID $ 27.00 NO BID NOBID 

Commercial 2 Base NO BID $ 6.30 NO BID NO BID 

Commercial Screenings NO BID $ 7.20 NO BID NOBID 

Type 0 & FF Aggregates NO BID $ 25.20 NOBID NO BID 

HMCL (0, F or Black Base) NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID 

Parking Lot Mix, 64-22, 97 Density NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

TxDOT 340 HM, TY 0 , 64-22, 97 Density $ 85.00 NO BID NO BID NOBID 

TxDOT 340 HM, TY 0, 64-22, 96 Density NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Rip Rap NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID 

Filter Stone NO BID $ 27.00 NO BID NOBID 

Remix NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID 

Torpedo Rock Grade NO BID NO BID NO BID 7.57/CY FOB PIT 

Cyclone Sand NOBID NOBID NO BID 15 .001CY FOB PIT 

Masonry Sand NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID 

LFili Sand NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID 

I Concrete Sand NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID 

Concrete Rock NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

i D-Beddin~o~(Citfl 
- - -

NO BID $ 16.00 NO BID 
- - -

NO BID 



Turner Pit - 6625 N. Burma Rd, Carlsbad. 
Based on Truck Size & Mileage. 
Delivery to San Angelo - 24 Ton Load + $7.09fTon 1816 DOUBLE BARREL RD, 

Haul ing charge to work site or yard? Delivery To San Angelo - 14 Ton Load + $10.60fTon BRONTE, TX 
- - - -


