SP RFB 13-010 "STATE GRADE AND ROCK BASE" SPREADSHEET

PRICES ARE GOOD UNTIL DECEMBER 09, 2013.

Company CSA MATERIALS, INC. INGRAM CONCRETE, LLC*
Treated Untreated Treated Untreated
Price per Ton price per Ton Price per Ton price per Ton
State Grade #1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
State Grade #2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
State Grade #3 $ 4625 $ 18.50 NO BID NO BID
State Grade #4 $ 46251 % 18.50 NO BID NO BID
State Grade #5 $ 47501 $ 18.50 NO BID NO BID
State Grade Base NO BID $ 525 NO BID NO BID
Pre-Coat Grade #3 $ 46.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pre-Coat Grade #4 $ 46.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pre-Coat Grade #5 $ 47.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Black Base with PG 64-22 82.65* NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cobbs NO BID $ 24.55 NO BID NO BID
Commercial 2 Base NO BID $ 4.85 NO BID NO BID
Commercial Screenings NO BID $ 5.60 NO BID NO BID
Type D & FF Aggregates NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
HMCL (D, F or Black Base) $ 86.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Parking Lot Mix, 64-22, 97 Density $ 89.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TxDOT 340 HM, TY D, 64-22, 97 Density $ 82.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TxDOT 340 HM, TY D, 64-22, 96 Density $ 79.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Rip Rap NO BID $ 62.75 NO BID NO BID
Filter Stone NO BID $ 2455 NO BID NO BID
Remix NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Torpedo Rock Grade NO BID NO BID NO BID 6.62/CY FOB PIT
Cyclone Sand NO BID "NO BID NO BID $14.00/CY FOB PIT
Masonry Sand NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Fill Sand NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Concrete Sand NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Concrete Rock NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
D-Bedding Rock (City) NO BID $ 8.00 NO BID NO BID




