SP RFB 12-006 "STATE GRADE AND ROCK BASE" SPREADSHEET PRICES ARE GOOD UNTIL DECEMBER 09, 20§12,
Company CSA MATERIALS, INC. p SANCO MATERIALS, INC.*
Treated Untreated Treated Untreated

Price per Ton price per Ton Price per Ton price per Ton
State Grade #1 NO BID % 18.05 NO BID NO BID
State Grade #2 NO BID $ 18.05 NO BID NO BID
State Grade #3 $ 4528 1 $ 18.05 NO BID NO BID
State Grade #4 $ 4528 | $ 18.05 NO BID NO BID
State Grade #5 $ 3988 | % 18.05 NO BID NO BID
State Grade Base NO BID $ 495 NO BID NO BID
Pre-Coat Grade #3 $ 45.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pre-Coat Grade #4 $ 45.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pre-Coat Grade #5 $ 39.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Black Base with PG 64-22 $ 83.58 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cobbs NO BID $ 24.55 NO BID NO BID
Commercial 2 Base NO BID $ 4.63 NO BID NO BID
Commercial Screenings NO BID $ 5.50 NO BID NO BID
Type D & FF Aggregates NO BID $ 10.25 NO BID NO BID
HMCL (D, F or Black Base) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Parking Lot Mix, 64-22, 97 Density $ 85.79 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TxDOT 340 HM, TY D, 64-22, 97 Density $ 82.78 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TxDOT 340 HM, TY D, 64-22, 96 Density $ 79.02 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Rip Rap NO BID $ 59.75 NO BID NO BID
Filter Stone NO BID $ 24.55 NO BID NO BID
Remix NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.30 B/RL
Torpedo Rock Grade NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.53 B/RL
Cyclone Sand NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.52/BRONTE ONLY
Masonry Sand NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Fill Sand NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.52/BRONTE ONLY
Concrete Sand NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.60 B/RL
Concrete Rock NO BID NO BID NO BID $27.00/ROBERT LEE ONLY
D-Bedding Rock (City) NO BID $ 8.00 NO BID NO BID




Turner Pit - 6625 N. Burma Rd, Carlsbad.

Based on Truck Size & Mileage.

Delivery to San Angelo - 24 Ton Load + $6.72/Ton
Delivery To San Angelo - 14 Ton Load + $8.37/Ton Bronte & Robert Lee Plants. Call for Quote.

Hauling charge to work site or yard?

Priced sales dependent upon material availability.



