
RFB 10-020 Furniture SP 
February 5, 2010 

DANKO· Eco-Eden Chairs 
Custom cutout 

Juvenile's 

Children's 

$ 517.56 $ 2,587.80 I $ 396.64 $ 1,983.20 $ NO BID NO BID 

92 I $ 75.76 $ 6,969.92 t $ 58.08 $ 5,343.36 I 88 $ 8,096.00 INO BID NO BID 

18 1$192.25 $ 3,460.501$154.40 $ 2,779.201239 $ 4,302.00 INOBID NO BID 

12 '$331.97 $ 3,983.64 I $292.68 $ 3,512.16 $ NO BID NO BID 

BID 


