Treated . T Untreated Treated Untreated

Price per Ton price per Ton Price per Ton price per Ton
State Grade #1 NO BID $ 17.27 NO BID NO BID
State Grade #2 NO BID $ 17.27 NO BID NO BID
State Grade #3 $ 39961 % 17.27 NO BID NO BID
State Grade #4 $ 390961 $% 17.27 NO BID NO BID
State Grade #5 3 34121% 17.27 NO BID NO BID
State Grade Base NO BID $ 4.60 NO BID NO BID
Pre-Coat Grade #3 3 39.96 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pre-Coat Grade #4 $ 39.96 NO BID NOBID NO BID
Pre-Coat Grade #5 3 3412 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Black Base with PG 64-22 $71.88* *Vendor bid max pricing. NO BID NO BID NO BiD
Cobbs $ 23.26 NO BID NO BID
Commercial 2 Base $ 4.09 NO BID NO BID
Commercial Screenings $ 478 NO BID NO BID
Type D & FF Aggregates $ 9.59 NO BID NO BID
HMCL (D, F or Black Base) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Parking Lot Mix, 64-22, 97 Density $ 74.64 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TxDOT 340 HM, TY D, 84-22, 97 Density | $ 71.75 NOBID NO BID NO BID
TxDOT 340 HM, TY D, 64-22, 96 Density | $ 68.74 NO BID NO BID NOBID
Rip Rap NO BID $ 56.60 NO BID NO BID
Filter Stone NO BID $ 23.26 NO BID NO BID
Remix NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 18.65
Torpedo Rock Grade NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 9.53
Cyclone Sand NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.52/BRONTE ONLY
Masonry Sand NO BID NO BID NO BID
Fill Sand NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.52/BRONTE ONLY
Concrete Sand . NO BID NO BID NO BID 3 18.07
Concrete Rock NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.20/ROBERT LEE ONLY
D-Bedding Rock (City) NO BID $ 7.29 NO BID NO BID
Hauling charge to work site or yard? Turner Pit. Current Haul Rate to San Angelo in 24 Ton Loads $5.58/Ton. Bronte & Robert Lee Plants. Call for Quote.




