
SP RFB 09-030 "ASPHALT AND OIL PRODUCTS" SpreadSheet 

P2 Emulsions Ergon Asphalt Asphalt Fuel 
Company Elm Mott TX Austin TX Tulsa OK 

YARD Wall Carlsbad Plant Wall Carlsbad Plant Wall Carlsbad Plant 
MC - 30 $ 2.84 $ 2.84 

SS-1 no bid $1.8229 $1.8304 $1.6500 

MC - 3000 $ 2.65 $ 2.65 

AC-5 $ 2.59 $ 2.59 

RC - 250 

AC -10 $ 2.64 $ 2.64 

CRS-2 2.77 2.77 2.52 $1.8329 $1.8479 $1.6500 

AC3 $ 3.06 $ 306 

HFRS2 $1.8729 $1.8804 $1.7000 

MC 2400Latex 

,...,.u.... 
L.82 2.82 2.52 $1.8329 $1.8479 $1.6500'-' vv r 

Month Contract 6 months 3 month 3 month 

current contract expires 6.9.09. 
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BID PROPOSAL
 
RFB 09-030
 

ASPHALT & OIL PRODUCTS 
Proposed bid price firm for the month of December (June 8, 2009 - July 9, 2009 .J Please furnish bid 
price per gallon delivered to TOM GREEN COUNTY yards and also FOB Plant, guaranteed for 1 month 
from award date, 

Please indicate below if your company will bid for: 
[D ]1 month [ [J] 3 months 
[~] 6 months [[J] 1 Year 

WALL YARD Located: 7393 FM 2334, Wall, Texas 
CARLSBAD YARD Located: 10929 Angelo, Carlsbad, Texas 

••__ •• _0 _ •••• _.... _.---- _."'-._- . ------ . ... - --- _. ... '- -.- . -- .... 

~L.II;~~l 
5.-uPC"2-1 012­

YOU MAY BID ON ONE: OR ALL OF THE FOLLOWING F.O,B, YARD. 
BID PRICE I BID PRICE FOB PLANT ESTIMATED 

DELIVERED I DELIVERED GALLONS 
PER PER GALLON PER NEEDED in 

GALLON GALLON 6months 
Wall Yard Carlsbad Yd I 

MC-3D IIfb 8,1) ND GIl) NV 0d) 40,000 
I, 

5S-1 * ND g tD /VD 6il'l i\rO 12¥,() 20,000 
I 

MC-3000 I fVD 8/1} tJD t61l) fJD P;ID 80,000 
I I , 

AC-5 pro f9/J) /VD 81v) /V7J /? /~) 180,000 
I I 

I 

RC-250 N7) 6(1) AI!) gl{)I Wi) 0,,) 
I 66,000 

I 
AC-10 f{D 19fT) Ni) f!J JI) NtJ 811\ 40,000 

-G-RS2-* f..'w/.;.-~ J/2·77 lr .E ")..·77"" 4J~ Jj')., 30,000 

AC3 ND tEtfJ /lID t3uj I1flJ @tf) 60,000 

HFRS2* ~ ,gJtf) IvD ,gll\ Ai) IbwFI 30,000 

MC 2400 LA TEX fVD 8,11) /V!) t8J1/\ At ~U\ 30,000 

CWP* t- fJJ :t.<j{d- .,y .11 ;;LS';f,"'f frJ-·5;;1, 30,000 

't- t2-wtP IS A' .5~-.scu-6U.{;~ f!2O(YlIGn,CW2-.y Ft)l2fVl.U[Aq. Or f2 £m U l/5w;J5, 

* Special instructions: 
88-1 please bid min load of 500 gal per load 
CRS2 please bid min load of 1500 gal per load 
HFRS2 please bid min load of 1500 gal per load 
CWP This is a brand Name Product. please bid min load of 1500 gal per load 

_ 582 ffiI11~.f{L:::!J P.1..0DuC/ / fi2.{ &(: ,--,15'- i~ D.e.ct..;;,z.S ()~ ~ )J04,J 5~t..QJ5 
~ _ DR ()?fZ.-.5 UE.5S Th!7-"rJ 5cJoU (; (-}-VU)/..JS Sc."l13j [LA 7D R-b/ fs,rtf OI/7/bfZ-ejJD/h­
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THE COMMISSIONERS' COURT RESERVES 
SUBMJITED. 

PZ /;?muL'5t.v,JS flArrJTS 
NAME OF COMPANY ­

6/ b S. Me L@;JPrri L,QUO 
ADDRESS 

___. 9d'YJ.. V'f} CITT.1_ T'f- ?u,.Y-o__..._ _ . 
CITY, STATE AND ZIP ­

THE RIGHT TO REJECT ANY OR ALL BIDS 

tL,fir JI.,j2~ 
SIGNATU 

fh./DY H{)Pt..i,J$, SkL'GS
 
PRINT NAME & TITLE
 

_.(J5tf). 8-~9-~ 033P~Q~;l~J-5,,!}~.-b3.3j 
TELEPHOI\JE FAX I~ 

ItJ5'f) 7Ib'~ qq If£} - /?'It? ~u '-'G 
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BID PROPOSAL 
RFB 09-030 

ASPHALT & OIL PRODUCTS 
Proposed bid price firm for the month of December (June 8, 2009 - July 9, 2009 .) Please furnish bid 
price per galion delivered to TOM GREEN COUNTY yards and also FOB Plant, guaranteed for 1 month 
from award date. 

Please indicate below if your company will bid for:
 
[0 ]1 month [ C!J] 3 months
 
[ ~ ] 6 months [ 0] 1 Year
 

WALL YARD Located: 7393 FM 2334, Wall, Texas
 
CARLSBAD YARD Located: 10929 Angelo, Carlsbad, Texas
 

-'. '" •. 

YOU MAY BID ON ON!= OR ALL OF THE FOLLOWING F.O.B. YARD. 
BID PRICE BID PRICE FOB PLANT 

DELIVERED DELIVERED 
PERPER GALLONPER 

GALLONGALLON 
Wall Yard Carlsbad Yd 
NO BIDMC-30 NO BID NO BID 

$1.8229SS-1 " $1. 8304 $1. 65 I 

NO BIDMC-30DO NO BID NO BID I 
I 

NO BIDAC-5 NO BID NO BID 

NO BIDRC-250 NO BID NO BID 

AC-10 NO BID NO BIDNO BID 

ESTIMATED 
GALLONS 
NEEDED in 

6months 

40,000 

20,000 

80,000 

180,000 

66,000 

40,000 
! 
i 

CRS2" . 30,000$1.65$1.8329 $1.8479 
".' ,-, o' /'~.: ~::>,<;.;'.,;~;' (;1:: d'>,\~ . .. ,'. ":"';'" .:......:; :. ;:., ,', :'.,.!:;1 ," ": ""/:'" 

,. ,i 
N()~I1).,;.,:, '.' ...• : <NO.'BID':' 'cO.,} :. ,'~~f'~'· ,:':::: ';:;:NO~ID'i': .' ',,:J:6O;Doo '.' .':,.~.v 

.. ,,,, . .~. .", ,;. ': 
". ~.~; . 

$1.8729 $1.8804 30,000$1. 70HFRS2" 

30,000NO BID NO BID NO BIDMC 2400 LATEX 

$1. 65 30,000$1.8479$1. 8329CWP" 

... 
';""... 

E:e'; 
':;' 

DELIVERED TO DELIVERED TO 
" Special instructions: WALL: CARLSBAD: FOB PLANT: 
SS-1 please bid min load of 500 gal per load - $3.5519/GALLON $3.6344/GALLON $1.65/GAL. 
CRS2 please bid min load of 1500 gal per load - $2.3206/GALLON $2.3 756/GALLON $1.65/GAL, 
HFRS2 please bid min load of 1500 gal per load - $2.3340/GALLON $2.3615/GALLON $1. 70/GAL 

CWP This is a brand Name Product. please bid min load of 1500 gal per load -
$2.3206/GALLON $2.3756/GALLON $1. 65/GAL 
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PLEASE EXPLAIN MISe. CHARGES lF DELIVERY BY PLANT IS AVAILABLE AND REQUESTED FOR 
FULL TRUCK LOAD QUANTITY BID IS FOR FULL TRANSPORT LOADS OF 5,500 GALLONS. FREIGHT IS 

BASED	 ON A FULL TRANSPORT LOAD, EVEN IF A FULL LOAD OF MATERIAL IS NOT ORDERED. THE COMMON." 
THE COMMISSIONERS' COURT RESERVES THE RIGHT TO REJECT ANY OR ALL BIDS 
SUBMITTED. 

ERGON	 ASPHALT & EMULSIONS, INC. ~1?~NAME OF COMPANY 
R. M.	 McKEMIE ­11612 RM 2244
 

·VICE PRESIDENT, MARKETING
BUILDING 1, SUITE 250 
PRINT NAME & TITLEADDRESS 
(512) 469-9292 TELEPHONE 

__ AIlST IN,__..TEXAS--18 738- . ~5-L2}_-4.69=0-3-9-1------FAX------ ---------..--_..-- ---- ----.--- ­

CITY, STATE AND ZIP	 TELEPHONE FAX 

CARRIER BILLS DEMURRAGE AT $80.00 PER HOUR, AFTER THE SECOND HOUR. PUMP AND HOSE 
CHARGE IS $80.00 PER LOAD. RETURN FREIGHT IS ONE-HALF OF THE OUTGOING TARIFF. 



--

/ 
./ 

./ 
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BID PROPOSAL 
RFB 09-030
 

ASPHALT & OIL PRODUCTS
 
Proposed bid price firm for the month of December (June 8, 2009 - July 9, 2009 .J Please furnish bid 
price per gallon delivered to TOM GREEN COUNTY yards and also FOB Plant, guaranteed for 1 month 
from award date. 

Please indicate below if yoyt'company will bid for: 
[ 0 ] 1 month [~n 3 months 
[0 ]6 months [ [J] 1 Year 

WALL YARD Located: 7393 FM 2334, Wall, Texas 
CARLSBAD YARD Located: 10929 Angelo, Carlsbad, Texas 

-
YOU MAY BID ON ONE OR ALL OF THE FOLLOWING F.O.B. YARD. 

BID PRICE BID PRICE ESTIMATED 
DELIVERED DELIVERED 

FOB PLANT 
GALLONS 

PER NEEDED in 
GALLON 

PER GALLON PER 
6monthsGALLON 

I

Wall Yard Carlsbad Yd 
:), •<"5 <-4.2 ."Se.tMC-30 (lIe.... 40,000 

...,SS-1 * 20,000-
MC-3000 J,.v5 I ':2, il5'" 80,000 

I 

die, 

AC-S . J . -::.~\ ~, :::.--; 180,000() Ie-.I 

- -RC-2S0 66,000I ­
'},llIL/AC-10 2. ~ 'f 40,000r'\ L. 

CRS2* I 30,000I 

-s.oc,.3.°",'AC3 60,000()\" 

-HFRS2* 30,000-

30,000MC 2400 LATEX 

CWP* 30,000 -- J ' ­
;. Special instructions: 
SS-1 please bid min load of 500 gal per load 
CRS2 please bid min load of 1500 gal per load 
HFRS2 please bid min load of 1500 gal per load 
CWP This is a brand Name Product. please bid min load of 1500 gal per load 



/ 
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PLEASE EXPLAIN MISC. CHARGES IF DELIVERY BX pLANT IS AVAILABLE AND REQUESTED FOR 
FULL TRUCK LOADQUANTITY~ 55"ct>sc-lIt"05 

THE COMMISSIONERS' COURT RESERVES THE RIGHT TO REJECT ANY OR ALL BIDS 
SUBMITTED. A 
,4"'ih,,1J ~ >....l S"\'rl" Uc 4-~ 

NAM OF COMPAI\JY J ~URE 
t.!Zt.-"Jo E .5)J~ j),.. .. "'7 SJ.c.. &cv 
ADDRESS 

---~~~E~~~/~£-------"---"--- --------­~f;~~t~:-_·fiE~.25..:=-.~t2.~_-----


