SP RFB 09-007 "ASPHALT AND OiL. PRODUCTS" SpreadSheet

October

Performance Grade P2 Emulsions Ergon Asphalt Martin Asphalt
Company Hitchcock, TX Eim Mott TX Austin TX Houston TX
YARD Wall Carlsbad| Plant] Wall Carlsbad | Plant] Wall Carlshad Plant Wall  Carlsbad] Plant
MC - 30 $ 495|% 495]3% 4.50
SS-1 2.20 2.20| 2.05 3.83 3.83| 2.75] $2.6210| $2.6399| $24000|$% 3.05(% 3.05(% 2860
MC - 3000 nb nb nb
AC-5 2.55 255 2.40 nb nb nb
RC - 250 $ 495(% 495]% 450
AC-10 2.55 2.55] 2.40 $ 360[% 3608 3.15
CRS -2 2.20 2.20] 2.05 3.83 3.83] 299] $2.6210 | $2.6399 | $2.4000 | nb nb nb
AC3 nb nb nb
HFRS2 2.15 215} 2.00 3.83 3.83[ 2.99] $2.6710| $2.6899 | $2.4500{ nb nb nb
MC 2400Latex nb nb nb
CWP 3.83 3.83] 2.75[ $2.6210[ $2.6399 $2.4000{nb nb nb

1 Month Contract

contract expires

11.30.08
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BID PROPOSAL
RFB 09-007
ASPHALT & OIL PRODUCTS
Proposed bid price firm for the month of September (November 11-30, 2008) Please furnish bid price
per gallon delivered to TOM GREEN COUNTY yards and also FOB Plant, guaranteed for 1 month from
award date.

WALL YARD Located : 7393 FM 2334, Wall, Texas
CARLSBAD YARD Located: 10929 Angelo, Carlsbad, Texas

YOU MAY BID ON ONE OR ALL OF THE FOLLOWING F.O.B. YARD.
BID PRICE BID PRICE FOB PLANT ESTIMATED
DELIVERED | DELIVERED GALLONS
PER PER GALLON PER NEEDED in
GALLON GALLON 6months
Wall Yard Carlsbad Yd
MC-30 o BiD Y — — 40,000
§S8-1 * 2 20 A - Ao 2 -0s 20,000
MC-3000 ngeBid — — 80,000
AC-5 .55 AL-5S 2 -¥o 180,000
RC-250 Ao £/ D -_ - — 66,000
AC-10 2L-S 5 2 -S 5 2 -¥o 40,000
CRS2 * A - 2P 2 -0 2-05 30,000
AC3 o D — _ — 60,000
HFRS2 * A /5 2 -/ 2-900 30,000
A P M
MC 2400 LATEXM? 572 — — — 30,000
cwp N Bd — — = 30.000

* Special instructions:

S5S-1 please bid min load of 500 gal per load

CRS2 please bid min load of 1500 gal per load
HFRS2 please bid min load of 1500 gal per load
CWP please bid min load of 1500 gal per load

Please also bid partial loads under 5,000 gals on MC30, MC3000, AC-5, AC-3, AC-10, MC2400 LATEX
AND RC-250 '

Dﬁr hmance
Srpda Aselodt
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award date,

WALL YARD Located : 7393 FM 2334, Wall, Texas

BID PROPOSAL
RFB 09-007
ASPHALT & OIL PRODUCTS
Proposed bid price firm for the month of September (November 11-30, 2008} Please furnish bid price
per gallon delivered to TOM GREEN COUNTY yards and also FOB Plant, guaranteed for 1 month from

CARLSBAD YARD Located: 10929 Angelo, Carlsbad, Texas

YOU MAY BID ON ONE OR ALL OF THE FOLLOWING F.O.B. YARD. ]
BID PRICE BID PRICE FOB PLANT ESTIMATED
DELIVERED | DELIVERED GALLONS
PER PER GALLON PER NEEDED in
GALLON GALLON 6months
Wall Yard Carlsbad Yd |
' MC-30 ND #\D NO @D No A1D 40,000
$S-1* #3.%52 #3.¥> #2275 20,000
MC-3000 NO D NC 81D N2 21D 80,000 |
AC-5 ND_ D NO_ @10 NO_A\D 180,000 |
A |
RC-250 NO_ @1\0 NO B\D NO BAD 66,000 |
AC-10 NO B iD NO /1\D NC Pid 40,000
a
CRS2* 43.52 43.82 85499 30,000 |
AC3 NO A\ No 21D ND 34D 60,000
HFRS2 * #3.83 438> #2299 30,000
J
| MC 2400 LATEX | Np 81D ND 81D ND A 1© 30,000 |
CWP* £3.53 4352 “F Q.78 30,000

* Special instructions:

SS-1
CRS2
HFRS2
Cwp

please bid min load of 500 gal per load

please bid min load of 1500 gal per load
please bid min load of 1500 gal per load
please bid min load of 1500 gal per load

Wl (st
%u‘lfaz,m { rbO)
sau\d%uﬁ (See AT,

Sufeti
ERUALEY fswe ik

(s mmcneo)

Please also bid partial loads under 5,000 gals on MC30, MC3000, AC-5, AC-3, AC-10, MC2400 LATEX

AND RC-250

P& Ema |2lon 8
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BID PROPOSAL

RFB 09-007
ASPHALT & OIL PRODUCTS
Proposed bid price firm for the month of September (November 11-30, 2008) Piease furnish bid price
per gallon delivered to TOM GREEN COUNTY yards and also FOB Plant, guaranteed for 1 month from

award date.

WALL YARD Located : 7383 FM 2334, Wall, Texas
CARLSBAD YARD Located: 10929 Angelo, Carlsbad, Texas

YOU MAY BID ON ONE OR ALL OF THE FOLLOWING F.Q.B. YARD.
BID PRICE BID PRICE FOB PLANT ESTIMATED
DELIVERED | DELIVERED GALLONS
PER PER GALLON PER NEEDED in
GALLON GALLON 6months
Wall Yard Carlsbad Yd
MC-30 NO BID NO BID NO BID 40,000
|
SS-1* $2.6210 $2.6399 $2.40 20,000
MC-3000 NO BID NO BID NO BID 80,000
| AC-5 NO BID NO BID NO BID 180,000 |
B . I
RC-250 NO BID NO BID NO BID 66,000
AC-10 NO BID NO BID NO BID 40,000
CRS2 * $2.6210 $2.6399 $2.40 30,000
AC3 NO_BID NO BID NO_BID 60,000
HFRS2 * $2.6710 $2.6899 $2.45 30,000
1 MC 2400 LATEX | No BID NO BID NO BID 30,000
CWpP* $2.6210 $2.6399 $2.40 30,000

DELIVERED PRICES ARE BASED ON FULL TRANSPORT LOADS OF 5,500 GALLONS OR MORE.
DELIVERED TO DELIVERED TO

* Special instructions: WALL: CARLSBAD: FOB PLANT:

SS-1 please bid min load of 500 gal perload - $4.8310/GALLON $5.0389/GALLON $2.40/GALLC
CRS2 please bid min load of 1500 gal per load ~ $3.2103/GALLON $3.2796/GALLON $2.40/GALLC
HFRS2 please bid min load of 1500 gal per load = $3.2603/GALLON $3.3296/GALLON $2.45/GALLC
CWwWP please bid min load of 1500 gal per load - $3.2103/GALLON $3.2796/GALLON $2.40/GALLC

Please also bid partial loads under 5,000 gals on MC30, MC3000, AC-5, AC-3, AC-10, MC2400 LATEX
AND RC-250 -~ NO BID

grﬂéﬂ ﬂiP(f‘ﬁ I+
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BID PROPOSAL
RFB 09-007
ASPHALT & OIL PRODUCTS
Proposed bid price firm for the month of September (November 11-30, 2008) Please furnish bid price
per gallon delivered to TOM GREEN COUNTY yards and also FOB Plant, guaranteed for 1 month from
award date.

WALL YARD Located : 7393 FM 2334, Wall, Texas

CARLSBAD YARD Located: 10929 Angelo, Carlsbad, Texas S avo 7'4%/ per Lond,

YOU MAY BID ON ONE OR ALL OF THE FOLLOWING F.O.B. YARD.
BID PRICE BID PRICE FOB PLANT ESTIMATED
DELIVERED | DELIVERED GALLONS
PER PER GALLON PER NEEDED in
GALLON GALLON months
Wall Yard Carlsbad Yd
' MC-30 4. 9 4q. 95 q4.5¢ 40,000
| _
SS-1* .05 2.0 2.60 20,000
MC-3000 NG L D NS 80,000
AC-5 VB 73 VIS 180,000
RC-250 . e5 4 G< 450 66,000
AC-10 LD 340 3 K 40,000
CRS2* AMNE MDD x 03 30,000
AC3 ND rE NM/7? 60,000
HFRS2 * M3 MR MR 30,000
ND k3
MC 2400 LATEX w73 . NMNS 30,000
CWP* R y e N2 30,000

* Special instructions:

5S8-1 please bid min load of 500 gal per load

CRS2 please bid min load of 1500 gal per load
HFRS2 please bid min load of 1500 gal per load
CWP please bid min load of 1500 gal per load

Please also bid partial loads under 5,000 gals on MC30, MC3000, AC-5

AND RC-250

, AC-3, AC-10, MC2400 LATEX

m«HM QSPW +




