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award date.

WALL YARD Located : 7393 FM 2334, Wall, Texas

BID PROPOSAL
RFB 08-040

ASPHALT & OIL PRODUCTS
Proposed bid price firm for the month of September (September 1-30, 2008.) Please furnish bid price
per gallon delivered to TOM GREEN COUNTY yards and also FOB Plant, guaranteed for 1 month from

CARLSBAD YARD Located: 10929 Angelo, Carlsbad, Texas

YOU MAY BID ON ONE OR ALL OF THE FOLLOWING F.0.B. YARD.

BID PRICE BID PRICE FOB PLANT ESTIMATED
DELIVERED | DELIVERED GALLONS
PER PER GALLON PER NEEDED in
GALLON GALLON 6months
Wall Yard Carlsbad Yd
MC-30 .24 4.29 ala 40,000
SS-1* ola ola nle 20,000
MC-3000 H.3a 4.3 nle 80,000
AC-5 3,49 = g ol 180,000
RC-250 ala n 2 nle 66,000
AC-10 3.2y 23.3% YR 40,000
CRS2* o le A ala 30,000
AC3 3. 57 3.57) n lg 60,000
HFRS2 * ale o le nle 30,000
MC 2400 LATEX ol ale ol 30,000
CWP* ol A n l« 30,000

* Special instructions:

SS-1
CRS2
HFRS2
CwpP

please bid min load of 500 gal per load

please bid min load of 1500 gal per load
please bid min load of 1500 gal per load
please bid min load of 1500 gal per load




: ( Products

SE EXPLAIN MISC. CHARGES IF DELIVERY BY PLANT IS AVAILABLE AND REQUESTED FOR
BLL TRUCK LOAD QUANTITY:

THE COMMISSIONERS' COURT RESERVES THE RIGHT TO REJECT ANY OR ALL BIDS

SUBMITTED.
A5D\u\‘\' & L Sce o\gj,_U_C Wi%\

NAME OF COMPANY SIGNATURE

Qoo € sk, Devw ) Sui\e Lo M Rebecls VP

ADDRESS PRINT NAME & TITLE

s, O 74135 S\g- 85 -1335 A/Jf—ﬁ:’l&%s’ﬂ
CITY, STATE AND ZIP TELEPHONE FAX
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BID PROPOSAL
RFB 08-040
ASPHALT & OIL PRODUCTS

Proposed bid price firm for the month of September (September 1-30, 2008.) Please furnish bid price
per gallon delivered to TOM GREEN COUNTY yards and also FOB Plant, guaranteed for 1 month from
award date.

WALL YARD Located : 7393 FM 2334, Wall, Texas
CARLSBAD YARD Located: 10929 Angelo, Carlsbad, Texas

o 'YOU MAY BID ON ONE OR ALL OF THE FOLLOWING F.O.B. YARD.
e BID PRICE BID PRICE | FOB PLANT | ESTIMATED
: ~ + 4DELIVERED | DELIVERED GALLONS
g 7. PrR-- | PER GALLON ER NEEDED in
% S ‘ GALLON 6months
Carisbad Yd
40,000
6 I %0 20,000
80,000
3.S0 3.5 180,000
66,000
3_s» 3_i5 40,000
3,75 2 -0 30,000
3.5 35 60,000
oo .o 30,000
‘ 30,000
SERD 30,000

instructions:

~ please bid min load of 500 gal per load
- please bid min load of 1500 gal per load
please bid min load of 1500 gal per load
- please bid min load of 1500 gal per load
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PLEASE EXPLAIN MISC. CHARGES IF DELIVERY BY PLANT IS AVAILABLE AND REQUESTED FOR
FULL TRUCK LOAD QUANTITY:_¢ SS| CRSL, HFRs-2 W be

06040
& Oil Products

owered by 250 ¢ g ssljon kSt beho

THE COMMISSIONERS’ COURT RESERVES THE RIGHT TO REJECT ANY OR ALL BIDS

SUBMITTED.

forbocnence Grde fs ] N Lic

NAME OF COMPANY

P. O. Bbﬁ. é
ADDRESS

Mitheo o T 77513
CITY, STATE AND ZIP

Lot p—

SIGNATURE

C[ OJ'L‘/D wﬁax/ | presi St

PRINT NAME & TITLE “°

Yoa-78L - 770 L Vg gep 795
TELEPHONE FAX
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award date.

WALL YARD Located : 7393 FM 2334, Wall, Texas

BID PROPOSAL
RFB 08-040
ASPHALT & OIL PRODUCTS
Proposed bid price firm for the month of September (September 1-30, 2008.) Please furnish bid price
per gallon delivered to TOM GREEN COUNTY yards and also FOB Plant, guaranteed for 1 month from

CARLSBAD YARD Located: 10929 Angelo, Carlsbad, Texas

YOU MAY BID ON ONE OR ALL OF THE FOLLOWING F.O.B. YARD.
BID PRICE BID PRICE FOB PLANT ESTIMATED
DELIVERED DELIVERED GALLONS
PER PER GALLON PER NE_EDED in
GALLON GALLON 6months
Wall Yard Carisbad Yd
MC-30 NO_BID NO BID NO BID 40,000
SS-1* $2.8210 $2.8399 $2.60 20,000
MC-3000 NO BID NO BID NO BID 80,000
AC-5 NO BID NO BID NO BID 180,000
RC-250 NO BID NO BID NO BID 66,000
AC-10 NO BID NO BID NO BID 40,000
CRS2* $2.8210 $2.8399 $2.60 30,000
AC3 NO BID NO BID NO BID 60,000
HFRS2 * $2.8210 $2.8399 $2.60 30,000
MC 2400 LATEX | NO BID NO_BID NO_BID 30,000
CWP* NO BID NO BID NO BID 30,000
* Special instructions: WALL YARD

S5S5-1
CRS2
HFRS2
cwpP

please bid min load of 500 gal per load
please bid min load of 1500 gal per load -
please bid min load of 1500 gal perload -
please bid min load of 1500 gal per load -

$5.0310/GALLON DELIVERED
$3.4103/GALLON DELIVERED

$3.4103/GALLON DELIVERED
NO BID

FOB PLANT PRICES SAME AS

CARLSBAD YARD
$5.2389/GALLC
$3.4796/GALLC
$3.4796/GALLO
NO BID

ABOVE,
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PLEASE EXPLAIN MISC. CHARGES IF DELIVERY BY PLANT IS AVAILABLE AND REQUESTED FOR
FULL TRUCK LOAD QUANTITY: FULL TRANSPORT LOAD IS 5,500 GALLONS OR MORE.

DEMURRAGE IS $80.00 PER HOUR AFTER THE FIRST TWO HOURS. PUMP AND HOSE CHARGE - $80.00/L0
THE COMMISSIONERS’ COURT RESERVES THE RIGHT TO REJECT ANY OR ALL BIDS
SUBMITTED.

ERGON ASPHALT & EMULSIONS, INC. WM

NAME OF COMPANY SIGNATURE)
11612 RM 2244, BUILDING 1, SUITE 250 R. M. McKEMIE
ADDRESS PRINT NAME & TITLE
(512) 469-9292 TELEPHONE
AUSTIN, TEXAS 78738 (512) 469-0391 FAX

CITY, STATE AND ZIP TELEPHONE FAX
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BID PROPOSAL

RFB 08-040
ASPHALT & OIL PRODUCTS
Proposed bid price firm for the month of September (September 1-30, 2008.) Please furnish bid price
per gallon delivered to TOM GREEN COUNTY yards and also FOB Plant, guaranteed for 1 month from

award date.

WALL YARD Located : 7393 FM 2334, Wall, Texas # $oco 14//0'/ Mistimihs pee Lind,

CARLSBAD YARD Located: 10929 Angelo, Carlsbad, Texas

YOU MAY BID ON ONE OR ALL OF THE FOLLOWING F.O.B. YARD.
BID PRICE BID PRICE FOB PLANT ESTIMATED
DELIVERED | DELIVERED GALLONS
PER PER GALLON PER NEEDED in
GALLON GALLON 6months
Wall Yard Carlsbad Yd
MC-30 . 9 495 450 40,000
SS-1* 3.0€ 3.05 2.60 20,000
MC-3000 B N/p nf8 80,000
AC-5 ~/B N[B HB 180,000
RC-250 .95 4 39S 4. <o 66,000
AC-10 3. 60 3. 60 2.1 40,000
CRS2* o[ N8 < /p 30,000
, N v L
AC3 /3 I o [B 60,000
HFRS2 * ~[D N[B 3 30,000
MC 2400 LATEX N[D N/8B N[p 30,000
CWP* ~[p H/B N8 30,000

* Special instructions:

SS-1 please bid min load of 500 gal per load

CRS2 please bid min load of 1500 gal per load
HFRS2 please bid min load of 1500 gal per load
CwWP please bid min load of 1500 gal per load



RFB 08-040
Asphalt & Oil Products

Page 6

PLEASE EXPLAIN MISC. CHARGES IF DELIVERY BY PLANT IS AVAILABLE AND REQUESTED FOR
FULL TRUCK LOAD QUANTITY:__ Seve gatlesr Miprimvr

THE COMMISSIONERS' COURT RESERVES THE RIGHT TO REJECT ANY OR ALL BIDS
SUBMITTED.

-

MQ&“’:J 4""‘/4' CN"AAA-’V \ . d
NAME OF COMPANY SIGNATURE
.77 Rlvetony {oide Had Tal Nimuo /.SA/FJ
ADDRESS PRINT NAME & TITLE
//oa-(-hd T 77056 713350 6849 /7/33!9 1349

- .CITY, STATE AND ZIP TELEPHONE FAX
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BID PROPOSAL
RFB 08-040
ASPHALT & OIL PRODUCTS
Proposed bid price firm for the month of September (September 1-30, 2008.) Please furnish bid price
per gallon delivered to TOM GREEN COUNTY yards and also FOB Plant, guaranteed for 1 month from

award date.

WALL YARD Located : 7393 FM 2334, Wall, Texas

CARLSBAD YARD Located: 10929 Angelo, Carisbad, Texas

YOU MAY BID ON ONE OR ALL OF THE FOLLOWING F.0.B. YARD.
BID PRICE BID PRICE FOB PLANT ESTIMATED
DELIVERED | DELIVERED GALLONS
PER PER GALLON PER NEEDED in
GALLON GALLON 6months
Wall Yard Carlsbad Yd
MC-30 No 61D NO_ WD NO B W 40,000
SS1* e 6. M D N BB 20,000
MC-3000 O 81D MO BLD NV BLD 80,000
AC-5 No P D 810 N 8D 180,000
RC-250 o 8D ND_ A1) o 8w 66,000
AC-10 NO R D MO DD N Bid 40,000
ERS2* Awiz2 | £2%3 33837 %29 30,000
AC3 ND AiD ND AU po B> 60,000
HFRS2 * D) Mo B D NG B0 30,000
MC 2400 LATEX | nO A D N B0 Ne BiD 30,000
CWP* 3%5 ¥ | 83953 ¥ €293 30,000

¥ (SEE ADDTIouAC PLopuets /FRICE UIST ATTACHED )

* Special instructions:

S$S-1 please bid min load of 500 gal per load

CRS2 please bid min load of 1500 gal per load
HFRS2 please bid min load of 1500 gal per load
cwpP please bid min load of 1500 gal per load

W PRUE & For. 150 GAtloN LOAD 2 my pmount 1ESS TMN

S5c00 GARLONS. SOE ADMoNgL lopuis /pucé tsrt
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PLEASE EXPLAIN MISC. CHARGES IF DELIVERY BY PLANT IS AVAILABLE AND REQUESTED FOR

FULL TRUCK LOAD QUANTITY:
(SEE_TRcHED Peopucr JPRCG et )
THE COMMISSIONERS' COURT RESERVES THE RIGHT TO REJECT ANY OR ALL BIDS

SUBMITTED.
P2 emuison PLANTS W&%ﬂéﬂﬂ"

NAME OF COMPANY SIGNATURE

51t S. Melepnan Leoe JAMES A. HotINS | Spre

ADDRESS PRINT NAME & TITLE

ELm moTr, TX 76640 (3—64\ §29- 0330 -VFIZE (95¢) X’)Cf 033
CITY, STATE AND ZIP TELEPHONE FAX

(254) T -9940 - MosiLE



pz Emulsion Plants, L.L.C.

516 S. McLennan Loop
Elm Mott, Texas 76640
Phone (254) 829-0330 Fax (254) 829-0337
p2emulsions@sbcglobal.net

Contact: Andy Hopkins Cell: {254)716-9940

rm  Foz Moy oF

BID FOR RFG # 08 -040_(1om cacen) DATE: __5¢Temgee i-30, 2%
Tanker Tanker

Product FOB Plant FOB County Tote/Drum

CWE-2/ CWP......neeunnn. $2.99/Gallon......... $3.24/Gallon.......... $3.24/Gallon

Cold (All) Weather Chip Seal Emulsion/ All Weather Pot Hole Patch Emulsion

P2 Prime (premixed)... $1.40/Gallon......... $1.60/Gallon.......... $1.60/Gallon
Premixed, ready to use

P2 Prime concentrate...$2.75/Gallon......... $2.99/Gallon.......... $2.99/Gallon
Mixes with 6 parts water to make a prime, 4 parts water to make a tack

P2 Stabilizer................. $2.75/Galion......... $2.99/Galion.......... $2.99/Gallon
Asphalt Base Stabilizer

P2 Rejuvenator............ $2.79/Gallon......... $2.99/Gallon.......... $2.99/Gallon
Asphalt Rejuvenator

RO.C..... e $2.99/Gallon......... $3.24/Gallon.......... $3.24/Gallon
Road Over Coat for Chip Seal Roads

Minimum of 2 days order notice requested.
Minimum Tanker Delivery: 5,000 Gallons.
Smaller Quantities Available, Subject to Freight Differential.

Demurrage: First 2 hours free, $70.00 per hour there after.
Pump Charge: $70.00 if needed.

“Tote” Containers (275 gallons) cost $149.00 for each container. Plus material.
Plus Common Carrier Freight. Totes are re-usable and can be re-filled.

Drum Containers (55 gallons) cost $29.00 for each container. Plus material.
Plus Common Carrier Freight.



08.05.08

SP RFB 08-040 "ASPHALT AND OIL PRODUCTS"

SpreadSheet

Alon USA Asphalt & Fuel Supply Clevland Asphalt* Ergon Asphalt Martin Asphait
Company DALLAS, TX Tulsa, OK Shepard TX Austin TX Houston TX
YARD Wall Carlsbad| Plant Wall Carlsbad Plant Wall Carlsbad Plant Wall [Carlsbad| Plant Wall  Carlsbad| Plant
MC - 30 4.38 4.38 $ 495(% 495]%4.50
SS-1 $2.8210 1$2.8399 [$2.6000 | $ 3.05[$ 3.05[ $2.60
MC - 3000 4.32 4.32 nb nb nb
AC-5 3.48 3.48 nb nb nb
RC - 250 $ 495(% 495[%$450
AC-10 3.38 3.38 $ 360|% 360]%$3.15
CRS -2 $2.8210 1$2.8399 [$2.6000 | nb nb nb
AC3 3.51 3.49 nb nb nb
HFRS2 $2.8210 |$2.8399 [$2.6000 | nb nb nb
MC 2400Latex nb nb nb
CWP nb nb nb
1 Month Contract
contract expires 9.30.08




08.05.08

Company Performance Grade P2 Emulsions
Hitchcock, TX Elm Mott TX

YARD Wall Carlsbad| Plant Wall Carlsbad Plant
MC - 30 no bid no bid no bid | no bid no bid no bid
S§S-1 $ 460]|$ 460} 9% 2.40] nobid no bid no bid
MC - 3000 no bid no bid | no bid | no bid no bid no bid
AC-5 $ 3.50|% 3.50]¢% 3.15] no bid no bid no bid
RC - 250 no bid no bid no bid | no bid no bid no bid
AC-10 $ 3.50f% 3.50] 9% 3.15] no bid no bid no bid
CRS -2 $ 375[% 375]1%$240]5% 3831% 3.83 1% 299
AC3 $ 3.50(% 3.50]|% 3.15] nobid no bid no bid
HFRS2 $ 400|% 4.00]$% 2.60] nobid no bid no bid
MC 2400Latex | no bid no bid no bid | no bid no bid no bid
CWP $3.83 $3.83 $2.99




