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025
SP RFB 08448"ASPHALT AND OIL PRODUCTS" SpreadSheet
ALON USA Asphalt & Fuel Supply | Clevland Asphalt* Ergon Asphalt Martin Asphalt Performance Grade
Company DALLAS, TX Tulsa, OK Shepard TX Austin TX Houston TX Hitchcock, TX
YARD Wall Carlsbad Wall Carlsbad Wall Carlshad Wall Carlsbad Wall Carlsbad
* MC - 30 /] ) $4.7457| $4.7457 $ 4231% 4.23] nobid no bid
S$S-1 $2.4557| $2.4557] $2.5647 | $2.5855]1% 223|% 223]% 260|%$ 260
MC - 3000 3.75 3.72] $4.7457) $4.7457 no bid no bid
_—
%\’0 -5 3.70 3.67] $3.8457| $3.8457 $ /330]$ /3.30/
N Q
RC - 250 $4.4457| $4.4457 $ 323]% 3.23]|nobid no bid
.d.ﬂ. AC-10 $ 285]|% 285 3.65 3.62] $3.8457| $3.8457 $ 3.08(NS 3.08)% 330]% 330
FOB | PLANT
CRS -2 $2.7257) $2.7257| $2.5647 | $2.5855]% 2281% 228]9% 2601%$ 260
AC3 3.80 3.77] $3.8457| $3.8457 $ 360]% 3.60
HFRS2 $2.7257| $2.7257] $2.5647 | $2.5855 3 275|% 275
MC 2400Latex no bid no bid no bid no bid

1 Month Contract

contract expires 7/31/08.

*Price Good on MC-30, MC-3000 and RC250 for 30days. Others please call for daily price




